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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-01 (Old Box 95C) PAGES 

Holyoke Junior College, a division of Holyoke Public Schools: physical 
properties (description of facilities), library, enrollment, faculty; American 
Association of Junior Colleges, provisional member 

1-2, 8,11, 
21-23, 29-

31 

List of numbers of student transfers to other institutions 4, 10 

Holyoke Junior College faculty 1948-49 4-7, 24-25 

Typewritten list of faculty members of Holyoke Junior College 1947-48 12-14 

Typewritten list of faculty members of Holyoke Junior College, no date 15 

Statistics: students entering the College in 1946, 1947, and 1948; no. of 
transfers; nos. of students by division 

16-17, 19, 
20 

Typewritten notes about Holyoke Junior College foundation, student 
enrollment for 1946-1949; student transfers 

18 

Holyoke Junior College academic policies: schedules and credits, grading 
system, honors, scholastic probation, requirements for graduation, 
examinations, attendance, tardiness, recommendations for transfer, minimum 
requirements for participation in student activities 

26-28 

Item 11. Equipment in Junior College laboratories, physics, chemistry and 
biology 

32 

Expenditures for Holyoke Junior College as reported in the annual reports of 
the School Department of the City of Holyoke: salaries, maintenance, and 
income 

33 

List of teachers and their qualifications for Holyoke Junior College 34-38 

List of faculty Holyoke Junior College for 1951-1952 39 

Blank card: Information required of instructors [front side] and hours available 
for instruction, recommended textbook [reverse side] 

40-41 

Budget estimates for supplies and equipment for the school year 1949 for 
Holyoke Junior College: 12 items for total of $6,750 

42 

Receipt from City of Holyoke for Junior College postage 43 

Single salary schedule for Holyoke Public Schools by academic degree along 
with salary differentials 

44-45 

Apparatus wanted for physics dept., 1949, detailed list with prices 46-47 

Additional academic regulations adopted by the faculty December 14, [1957]  
Cheating, curricula, general education courses at the Junior College, dated 
2/5/58 

48 

Department of Veterans benefits: information bulletin, vocational 
rehabilitation and education, dated May 16, 1958 

49 

Extract from Public Law 550, 82nd Congress, Chapter 875, 2d Session, H.R. 
7656: act to provide educational readjustment and to restore lost educational 
opportunities to certain persons who served in the Armed Forces on or after 
June 1950… [GI Bill] Part IV, section 253 

50-51 

Resume for George E. Frost to 1955? 52 

Extract from Public Law 550, 82nd Congress, Chapter 875, 2d Session, H.R. 
7656: act to provide educational readjustment and to restore lost educational 
opportunities to certain persons who served in the Armed Forces on or after 
June 1950… [GI Bill] Part IV, section 254-256 

53-55 

Refund policy under Public Law 550 - if students fails to enter the course or 
withdraws or is discontinued - pro rated refund 

56-57 

Letter to Chief Administrative Officer at Holyoke Junior College from the 
Commonwealth of Massachusetts, Department of Education, Board of 

58 
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Collegiate Authority, James E. Burke re changes in the curriculum for veteran 
retraining, requests college catalog, fill out questionnaire 

List of qualifications of teachers 59-61, 68 

List of Holyoke Junior College faculty, school year 1959-1960 62-65 

Page 2 of questionnaire: statistics about college building 66 

Memo from Commonwealth of Massachusetts, Department of Public Health, 
Roy Feemster, Director, Division of Communicable Diseases, re end of polio 
vaccine program, dated September 30, 1957 

67 

Faculty pay roll for various months in 1952, 1953, 1954, and 1955 69-97 

Revised list of prospective candidates for graduation in June 1960 from the 
Junior College 

98 

Suggestions for…from faculty? Re purpose of instruction, preparation, class 
outline, and their format 

99 

Articles re grading systems, student's semester hours 100-101 

Notice to faculty re faculty meeting schedule for academic year 1961-1962; 
typed card with graduation speech conferring degrees to class of 1963 

102 

List of graduates June 1953 for the Junior College 103 

Exam schedule, list of faculty, rooms, times 104-105 

List of students who have withdrawn from classes in March 106-107 

List of students not permitted to sit for finals in specified courses 108 

2 pages of a survey of present and projected enrollments and faculty needs 
in New England colleges and universities signed by George Frost 

109-110 

List of administrators, faculty, and staff at Holyoke Junior College for 1962-
1963 

111-117 

List of administrators, faculty, and staff at Holyoke Junior College for 1963-
1964 

118-125 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-02 (Old Box 95D) PAGES 

Notice to the students re National Defense Education Student Loan program 
and the conditions for a loan 

1-2 

Memos from the University of Massachusetts, Office of the Business 
Manager, Edward Manookian, dated November 1953 re chest x-ray for 
George Richason, Robert St. Clair, and John Tyler 

3-5 

Letter from the National Association of College Stores, September 20, 1951 
re the sale of textbooks to students by faculty, list of colleges included 

6-12 

Letter from National Safety Council re safety of faculty and campus 
employees, May 1951, questionnaire included; safety exchange (of ideas) 
from Winter 1950 included 

13-15 

Carbon copy of note in response to some questions re Holyoke Junior 
College and its program to someone in Marquette, MI; approx. date 1957. 

16 

Letter to William Dean at Holyoke Trade High School from the State Dept. of 
Education, Robert Nolan, re real estate; dated Oct. 31, 1962 

17 

Holyoke Junior College: special adult program in community services offered 
at HJC: Great Books Course; CPS review (for professional secretaries); 
Science for schools of nursing; Terminal basic engineering and business 
administration curriculum; National Conference of Christians and Jews; Labor 
Relations 

18-19 

Letter to Newton Junior College(?) in answer to their question about a book 
with questions about their number of faculty, students; teaching duties for 
administration; no date 

20 

Carbon copy of a speech (?) perhaps a radio program re changes in the 
world and the need for higher education 

21-23 

Copy of a letter send to Edward Larkin, UMass, from P. R. Mayo re 
replacement of a filter on a microscope at Holyoke Junior College; dated April 
23, 1958 

24 

Letter to Manpower from Saul Goldfarb of General Capital Corp., NY re need 
for married couple to run a 9 hole golf course in Northampton; dated June 2, 
1958 

25 

Form letter from Manpower, J. Kevin Griffin, offering teachers temporary 
work for the summer 

26 

Handwritten letter from John Meilenkasis (?) re admission to the college; 
dated July 1958 

27 

Page 3-4 of notes detailing the salary schedule and requirements from the 
Division of State Teachers Colleges, Boston 

28-29 

Copy of letter to Joseph Cass, Boston, re higher education in Mass. at the 
local college level, i.e. community college, from Alden Eberly 

30-31 

Form letter from New England Newsclip Agency re their services 32 

Mimeographed copy of Fire precautions and regulations at Holyoke Junior 
College (prior to Jan. 4, 1968 fire) (3 copies): what to do if you discover a fire, 
exit assignments, general procedures, evacuation areas, and note to 
instructors 

33-38 

Mimeographed agenda for a meeting to be held at the Yankee Pedlar re 
cheating policy, academic standards, graduation requirements, general 
education courses, and new instructors and administrators (1955?) 

39 

Notice to faculty from George Frost re scholarship in memory of Frederick 
Cramer; 12/7/54 

40 
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Note to faculty from A. P. Garvey re list of newspapers and periodicals 
received in Holyoke Junior College Library; made additions and return; 
11/1/55 (?) 

41 

List of books for courses, second semester, 1954-1955 42-43 

2 mimeographed lists of the schedule of classes, second semester, times, 
rooms, and instructors; Feb. 1955 - June 1955 

44-47 

Examination schedule for first semester 1954-1955 48-52 

Random notes re discussions with other directors, visiting high schools @ 
opportunities at Holyoke Junior College, faculty sources, transportation 
courses, nursing program, Economics in Action program, member of 
American Association of Junior Colleges 

53-54 

Letter from The Lions' Pause, publication of the Holyoke Lions Club, with 
lengthy description of Dr. George Frost tracing the growth of the 2 year public 
or junior college from the 19th century to the present; Oct. 23, 1961 

55-56 

List of college presidents and superintendents of schools in the area 57 

Readings on junior college education for faculty members 58 

List of people invited (?) to Inauguration of Dr. Leonard (blank) October 26, 
1961 

59-60 

Program of dedication of South Hadley High School, Dec. 9, 1956 61-63 

Announcement from the State Board of Education re new commissioner: 
Owen Kiernan; August 5, 1957 

64 

Remnants of 2 postcards addressed to Holyoke Junior College: one 
requesting a college catalog, the other from the Post Office re a package 

65 

Agenda for a panel meeting, April 15, 1957, re mathematics in grade 7-12; 
place of the junior college in the educational scheme; math and science at 
the junior college level; terminal vocational curricula; general education 
curricula; community service; future needs and problems 

66-68 

Secondary school curriculum study from the Holyoke Public Schools 
submitted by William Dean, Herbert Schmidt, and George Frost 

69-72 

Letter from Richard McDonald, stationed in Italy, seeking admission to the 
Holyoke Junior College 

73 

Education certificate application for student group hospital-surgical-medical 
insurance for student Joseph Rogers; 1961 

74-77 

Notice from Civil Service of appointment of former Holyoke Junior College 
student: John O'Brien; Oct. 2, 1961 

78 

AIC convocation commemorating the 70th anniversary of the founding of the 
college; Oct. 20, 1955 

79 

Original copy of speech or radio talk (previously noted at pages 22-23) with 
changes penned in 

80-82 

Speech or talk commemorating 10 years of service at Holyoke Junior 
College; 1956 

83 

Summary of awards for school furniture, June 26, 1961, Holyoke Public 
Schools and the report 

84-87 

Agenda or minutes for Holyoke Lions Club meeting, Nov. 13, 1952, one topic 
What the junior college means to Holyoke 

87 

Letter to Mrs. B. McLaughlin at Science Electronics, Cambridge, MA re the 
non receipt of ordered equipment 

88 

Holyoke Junior College hockey schedule 89 

Letter to Westinghouse Electric Co., re repair of a meter 90 
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Secondary school curriculum study, Holyoke Public Schools from William 
Dean, Herbert Schmidt, and George Frost 

91-92 

Handwritten list of tuition fees, lab fees, activity fees and graduation fees 
collected 1950 

93-97 

Breakdown of enrollment, according to semester hours of study: GIs nurses, 
non GIs  1947? 

98-100 

Holyoke Junior College enrollment figures 1948-1949 101 

Aug. 30, 1949, list of veterans entering second semester who paid $10 
registration fee and need reimbursement 

102-103 

Letter to Frances Callahan of the Holyoke School Department from Holyoke 
Junior College re reimbursement of fees and vouchers for benefits  

104-105 
& 112 

List of Holyoke clubs and their contact persons? 106 

List of guidance counselors at local high schools 107 

Mailing list for commencement invitations, June 1953 108-111 

Note re purchase of 3¢ stamps for Holyoke Junior College, April 28, 1950 113 

Copy of Director's Honor Roll, undated 114 

7th Annual Program of Radio in Education, Holyoke Public Schools, 
sponsored by Holyoke Public Schools, Junior League of Holyoke, and Radio 
Station WHYN:  "Our schools in action" - Tuesday and Friday mornings 10am 
- 10:15am, November 4, 1952-May 26, 1953 

115 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-03 (Old Box 95E) PAGES 

Enrollment figures for 1947-1948 class as of December 11, 1947 1 

Letter to Dr. Rusk at Holyoke Junior College from H. J. Michalewicz re a 
Physics III lab and replacement of some materials 

2 

Director's Honor Roll list Feb. 20, 1963 3-5 

Holyoke High School graduates 1953 now enrolled at Holyoke Junior College, 
either full or part time 

6 

Bill to Holyoke Hospital for a course in anatomy & physiology for student 
nurses, Sept. 26, 1949 

7 

Note from W. H. Holmes re explosion in a chemistry lab, the only casualty 
other than the hydrogen generator was a glass shade on a light 

8 

Letter from a Korean student seeking admission to the junior college 9 

Note to someone wishing to enter the junior college from Dr. Frost 10 

Note date Jan. 4, 1962 re junior college science labs 11 

Contract blank from American Federation of Musicians to engage Tommy 
Taylor and 5 musicians to play at the Roger Smith Hotel for Holyoke Junior 
College Alumni some time in 1952, contract dated, May 12, 1952 

12 

Admission with advanced standing to University of Massachusetts, rules and 
regulations 

13-14 

Letter from the Massachusetts Scholarship Foundation, Committee on Awards 
awarding $800 to Ronald Ouellette to attend Holyoke Junior College, dated 
Aug. 8, 1958 

15-16 

Report card for a student named Vincent, from 2/7/55-6/8/55 17 

Holyoke Public Schools notice from William Peck, superintendent, to all 
employees re salary adjustments, November 27, 1956 

18-19 

Estimates of expenses for 1956 at the junior college 20-21 

List of people who contributed money to a cause, most likely United Way or 
Community Chest 

22 

Letter from Delcie re a transcript along with a stamped envelope, dated July 3, 
1962 

23-24 

Letter from the Mayor's Advisory Committee requesting attendance at a 
meeting, dated October, 2, 1963 

25 

Report of the judges of the Seyffer Motor…Tournament of Champions, judges: 
George Frost, timothy Burns, Charles Brinkman, 7/13/54 

26 

Letter from Louis Appel to Terry Heffron re basketball tournament, 3/6/56 27 

Letter from a lab instructor in chemistry from 1958-1960 re his attendance at 
the junior college and the encouragement of George Frost that made him 
remain a student and then go to Illinois to finish his education 

28 

Form from Funk & Wagnalls requesting statistical information, 1950 29 

Photostatic copy of the Great Seal of the Commonwealth, very faded, from 
Edward Cronin, Secretary of the Commonwealth, Oct. 16, 1958 

30 

Blank form: Request for information concerning commencement programs for 
the 1948 Commencement Manual 

31 

Holyoke Public Schools notice from William Peck, superintendent, to all 
employees re salary adjustments, November 27, 1956 

32-33 

Form letter to Chairmen of School Committees from the Commissioner of 
Education, Massachusetts, re Bible reading in public schools, Aug. 24, 1962 

34 

Schedule of junior college classes, 1962-63, at the Old Elmwood School, the 35 
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Holyoke High School Building, and the Holyoke Trade High School Bldg.  

Report of Committee on college student evaluation submitted by William 
Potvin who summarized some of the findings, May 25, 1960?;  statistics from 
answers to questionnaire by college students 

36-41 

Blank form for Holyoke Junior College requesting student information 42 

Schedule of classes for Holyoke Junior College, Sept. 18, 1952-Jan. 1953, 
lists the courses, rooms, meeting times, and the instructors 

43-44 

Program from AIC sponsored an evening with Vance Packard who will speak 
on "Education as Status", October 31, [1960]  

45 

Use of the Holyoke Junior College Library, rules on Reference and reserve 
books, students should act responsibly; from George Frost and Eileen 
McCarthy, librarian 

46-47 

Schedule of classes, Sept. 17, 1956 - Feb. 8, 1957; lists the courses, rooms, 
meeting times, and the instructors 

48-49 

Map showing winter parking for Holyoke Junior College faculty and students 50 

Form letter the chairman of American Education Week, Wilbur O'Donnell 51 

List of Holyoke High School teachers employed at [Holyoke Junior College?] 
9/5/63 

52 

Service of off duty police officers during Holyoke Junior College registration 
and book sale, list of offices, how long they worked, pay scale, 1963 

53 

Form memo from the Coordinating Committee on Scientific and Engineering 
Technicians re proposed legislation 

54-55 

Notice to all school personnel re chest x-ray examinations and reports from 
Holyoke Public Schools Superintendent, William Peck 

56-57 

Financial statement, June 1, 1953, for Holyoke Public Schools - appropriations 
and receipts, balances, etc. 

58 

Number of semester hours for school year19??, Holyoke Junior College 59 

Relation of salaries of part-time instructors… 60-61 

Schedule of events preceding the opening of classes for the fall semester 
1951-1952, Holyoke Junior College 

62 

Changes in part-time faculty, based on first semester faculty, Holyoke Junior 
College: instructors and their classes 

63 

Holyoke Public Schools, revised salary schedules of teaching personnel, 
regular and trade schools, rev. Jan. 1, 1957 

64-65 

Press release for Holyoke Transcript Telegram re George Frost and Mrs. 
George Frost's attendance at 41st Annual convention of American Association 
of Junior Colleges 

66 

Press release confirming 70 students accepted at Holyoke Junior College - 
1947 

67 

Press release stating Dr. George Frost will take up duties as head of the new 
state institution, Holyoke Community College 

68-69 

Great books course at Holyoke Junior College, Jan. 18, 1954 for Holyoke 
Daily Transcript, Springfield Daily News, Hampshire Gazette 

70 

Holyoke Junior College offers introductory traffic and transportation courses [ 
press release], [penciled in] Sept. 10, 1962 

71-72 

Transportation classes at Holyoke Junior College for second semester [press 
release] 

73-74 

Resume for Hans Spiegel  75 

Press release: Seventy students accepted to date at Holyoke Junior College 76 
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Holyoke Junior College, a unit of Holyoke Public Schools, announces second 
semester course beginning Feb. 10, 1948 [press release?] 

77 

Holyoke Junior College announces its first summer session program of 
college study beginning June 18, 1951 [press release] 

78-79 

Holyoke Junior College announces programs of college study for summer and 
fall sessions of 1951 from William Peck, Holyoke School Committee 

80-81 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-04 (Old Box 95F) PAGES 

Note from Neal to George [Frost] re list of books requested for library 
purchase, March 3, 1954 

1 

Letter of congratulations from Carroll Murphy on new baby addition to Frost 
family followed by request for letter of recommendation for position as 
superintendent of schools in Palmer, Nov. 12, 1950 

2 

Letter from Raymond Dunning, of Schaum Publishing, re trigonometry 
textbook desk copy 

3 

Letter from Marguerite Bligh, Dept. of Education, Div. Of University Extension,  
to Robert Denehy re state high school equivalency certificate, Nov. 11, 1954 

4 

Letter from United State Naval Academy, J. W. Rogers, Asst. Dean of 
Admission, to Mr. Grabowski re his application to the academy, 3/27/63 

5 

Form letter from American Council on Education re questionnaire 6 

Invoice from Kevin White for a copy of the General Laws Relating to 
Education, April 8, 1963 

7 

Form letter from Pioneer Valley Association re annual membership meeting in 
February, January 18, 1961 

8 

Form letter from Institute of International Education re the annual census of 
foreign students, August 15, 1961 

9 

Letter from Dept. of Health, Education, and Welfare re the 10th annual college 
business management institute; September 28, 1962; and list of publications 
to order 

10-12 

Letter from Mrs. Joseph Hilyard of a PTA in South Hadley, Mass., looking for 
entertainment for profit from a group or person at the College, June 13, 1962 

13 

Letter from Peter Sussman, Commission on Civil Rights, re enclosed report 
from the Massachusetts Advisory Committee; October 26, 1961 

14 

Letter from C. K. Bump, Monsanto Chemical Co., re information about evening 
courses in chemistry & engineering; Sept. 18, 1956 

15 

Form letter from Army Education Center, NY, requesting catalogs and specific 
information; Sept. 10, 1961 

16 

Letter from William McGrath, an art metal dealer in Holyoke, is retiring and 
recommends someone from Springfield to take his place; March 26, 1962 

17 

Letter from Hugh Moore referring to a letter to Pres. Kennedy; he wants 
people to endorse the appeal and write to the Pres.; Feb. 19, 1962 

18 

Form letter from College and University Business re return of a questionnaire; 
December 1961 

19 

Form letter from an organizing committee for the Northern New England 
Passenger Railroad Conference, most likely received at the college because it 
offered transportation classes; December 4, 1961 

20-22 

Order form to request reports from Educational Testing Service; 1961 23 & 25 

Order form for copies of calendar of meetings from National Catholic 
Education Association; 1961-62 

24 

Form letter requesting information about the college for a study sponsored by 
the Graduate School of Arts and Sciences at the Catholic University of 
America; March 22, 1956 

26 

Invitation to join National Society for the Study of Education and in return 
receive the 55th yearbook: Public Junior College; 1956 

27 

Form letter from American Academy of Dramatic Arts re summer sessions 28 

List of 3 names: Richard Stewart, Andrew Nachby, and Daniel Fitzgerald 29 
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Questionnaire from U.S. Office of Education, with answers 30-31 

Resume of unidentified person from P.E.I.  Canada 32 

Handwritten resume of unknown person 33-34 

Letter of recommendation for a Mr. Gorman 35 

Letter of recommendation from John Cullinane, Easthampton High School, for 
James Farrell for admission to Holyoke Junior College; undated 

36 

Second page of handwritten letter from Edward Kersage, University of Miami, 
Coral Gables, FL 

37 

Printed resume of unknown person 38 

Letter from Electric Boat seeking recommendation for employment of 
unknown person; Sept. 27, 1954 

39 

Form letter from U.S. Dept. of Labor, Martin Durkin, re job outlook for college 
graduates in 1953 

40 

Survey of college and university courses in radio and television from Dept. of 
Health, Education, and Welfare, not filled in 

41-48 

Form letter from Dept. of Health, Education, and Welfare re expansion in 
public 2 year college enrollment; 1956 

49 

Open letter from Secretary of Labor, Martin Durkin, to college seniors and the 
job outlook; April 13, 1953 

50-51 

Form letter from Rabbi Arnold Lasker and Rosamond Hendel re child 
psychology lecture-symposium intended for parents and titled: Influence of 
growth on children's need"; April 23, 1947 

52 

Outline of letter of recommendation to Dr. Evans Reid, Colby College, Maine 53 

Letter from American Trucking Associations requesting questionnaire sent 
earlier; college had transportation courses 

54 

Form letter from American Trucking Assoc. re survey of transportation 
education; please return survey quickly for Jan. report; October 11, 1963 

55 

Announcement of postponement of conference, Middle Atlantic State Study of 
Public Adult Education at Columbia University; October 11, 1963 

56 

Form letter from Aldenville American Legion Post Scholarship Committee re 
eligibility  requirements 

57 

Letter from Holyoke Savings Bank re annual meeting; March 13, 1956 58 

Form letter from Holyoke Junior Chamber of Commerce re fluoridation of the 
water in Holyoke 

59 

Form letter from Ohio State University, Dept. of Ophthalmology, , re course for 
orthoptic technicians, to teach the eyes to work together as a pair instead of 
one at a time; March 25, 1957 

60 

Form letter from Springfield Academy, a tutoring service, begins classes 61 

Thank you note from Holyoke Tuberculosis Assoc. for Christmas seal sale 62 

Form letter on behalf of Charles Widmayer re 2 resolutions passed at 
American College Public Relations Association meeting; Feb. 19, 1953 

63-64 

Questionnaire, 4 pages, not filled in 65-68 

Letter from Research Products, St. Petersburg, FL, selling a product called 
testing machines 

69 

Letter from Arthur Edwards, accounting firm, requesting course information for 
a future publication of Massachusetts Society of Certified Public Accountants; 
November 27, 1963 

70-71 

Form letter from New England Council requesting questionnaire return; 
January 31, 1958 

72 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-05 (Old Box 95G) PAGES 

Press release re schedule of Fall semester events at Holyoke Junior College, 
September 7, 1956 

1-2 

Document stating on Friday, March 6, at a regular meeting of Massachusetts 
Board of Regional Community Colleges, the Regional Community College at 
Holyoke was named Holyoke Community College 

3-4 

School of Nursing Committee minutes, May 23,1955 5 

List of teachers: colleges, subjects, teaching loads, and salaries for 1950s 6 

Notice of Faculty meeting Saturday, January 13, 1962 7 

List of teachers: colleges, subjects, teaching loads, and salaries for 1950s 8 

Schedule of classes for Fall semester 1952 9 

Envelope from Holyoke Junior College with notes: list of names and signature: 
W. E. Kudner 

10 

Form from Veterans Administration authorizing educational assistance 
allowance to Joy Malinowski 

11 

Academic policies for Holyoke Junior College: schedules, credits, grades, 
honors, probation, graduation, exams, attendance, tardiness, transfer 

12 

Resume for Dr. Francis M. Crowley 13 

Community Advisory Committee list of people, Holyoke Junior College 14-15 

Letter to James Bower re his willingness to serve on Citations Committee of 
Holyoke chapter, National Conference of Christians & Jews, March 16, 1962 

16 

Invoices: from Junior College Student Activity Fund to Holyoke TB Association 
and to Holyoke Community Chest (now United Way) , Nov. and Dec. 1957 

17-18 

Suggestions for course syllabus, 1959-1961 19-20 

Notice re faculty meeting Saturday, November 21, 1959? 21 

Notice to faculty re grades, faculty meetings, library hours, budget: 1958 22-23 

Bulletin #1 from George Frost re teachers oaths, absences, classrooms, 
school cancellations, attendance, progress, class registration, course cards, 
supplies 1958? 

24 

Bulletin #3 from George Frost re faculty meeting, semester exams and 
grades, schedule adjustments, registration, books and supplies, new courses, 
Jan. 16, 1959 

25-28 

Bulletin #4 from George Frost re Good Friday, quarterly grades, spring 
vacation, faculty meeting, faculty picture, candidates for graduation, March 24. 
1959 

29 

List of graduation candidates for June 1959 30 

Notice to faculty from George Frost re students who fail a class, 2/11 1959 31 

Letter to Director of Admissions re forthcoming visit of Edwina Luevanos from 
Guilderland Central High School, Guilderland Center, NY, Sept. 26, 1956 

32 

Draft international covenant of human rights revised at 1950 session of the 
United Nations Commission on Human Rights, October 17, 1950 

33 

Form letter from Federal Security Agency to colleges and universities 
receiving foreign students, 1948? 

34 

Selective Service and U.S. Office of Education regulations re induction of 
college students and enclosures: 

35-62 

Postponement of induction of students, summary 36-37 

Postponement of induction of students 38-41 

Commissioner of Education letters 42-43 

Operations Bulletin re college subjects, August 8, 1950 44 
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Commissioner's news letter, emergency supplement no. 2, August 17, 1950 45 

Types of information which institutions may wish to maintain currently on file, 
August 1950 

46-47 

Financial assistance for civilian college students: federal aid and non-federal 
aid, September 1950? 

48-49 

Form letters to college administrators 50-53 

Higher education, national defense, and public policy, opening session 
remarks by Earl James McGrath, Commissioner of Education, Oct. 6, 1950 

5-62 

Handwritten letter from Douglas Gray to the Registrar, Holyoke Junior College 
to take a math course 

63 

University of Massachusetts application for admission 64-67 

Attendance regulations 68-69 

Academic year 1957-1958 calendar of events 70 

3 page memo from William Field, Dean of Students, to President Lederle, 
University of Massachusetts, re intensive re-education for culturally and or 
economically deprived students, August 20, 1963 

71-73 

Memo from William Venman to George Frost and others re meeting to discuss 
intensive re-education of culturally and/or economically deprived students 

74 

Letter from Dr. Beautyman re vacancies in Pittsfield General Hospital in 
approved training school for medical technologists, April 23, 1957 

75-76 

Invoice for a book from American Association, Certified Medical Secretaries, 
November 14, 1951, followed by 4 page outline of book 

77-81 

Transcript and letter of recommendation from Northampton Commercial 
College re Kathleen Donohue, September 7, 1951 

82 

Letter to Kathleen Donohue from Charles Oak, principal, Northampton 
Commercial College re her application to teach at Holyoke Junior College, 
September 8, 1951 

83 

Transcripts for Helen Hedy Gurski from Lasell Junior College and High School 
of Commerce, References, and Personal data sheet 

84-87 

Resume for Warren Kudner  88 

List of textbooks to be used in Biological Science in the Medical Secretarial 
Curriculum 

89 

Medical Terminology texts for up to the minute training of medical secretaries 90 

Issue of Business Teacher, including setting up a Medical Secretarial 
Program, December 1950 and January 1951 

91 -end 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-06 (Old Box 95H) PAGES 

Letter to Alfred Knopf book company re freight bill for delivery to Holyoke 
Junior College, June 14, 1960 

1 

Letter from Mrs. Clayton Moore about registration of her son at the college 2 

Berkshire Community College in business, June 14, 1960 3 

Memo Gail Bradley, Medfield, MA, re League of Women Voters program on 
higher education in Massachusetts, October 20, 1960 

4-5 

Massachusetts Department of Education: Sate aid for public junior colleges for 
city of Holyoke, submitted by William Peck, August 16, 1960 

6 

List of instructors, their degrees, titles, teaching load, salaries (undated) 7-11 

List of students, due to excessive absences, not permitted to "sit" for final 
exams, May 25, 1959 

12 

Form letter from George Frost to faculty re new academic year, convocation, 
first faculty meeting, and registration changes, 1958? 

13 

Statement prepared by the Salary Committee of Holyoke Junior College for 
the Holyoke School committee: Time of crisis, signed by Edward Welch, 
Nicholas Russo, Alan McGee, George Richason, John Mitchell, Stewart 
Garrison, Neal DeNood, 11/3/58 

14-17 

A statement in support of the requested revision of the faculty salary schedule 
at the Holyoke Junior College signed George Frost 

18-20 

List of faculty and staff, addresses, and salaries 21-25 

Notice to faculty re new salary schedule for Spring 1957 signed George Frost 26-27 

List of [seniors] at Precious Blood High School, college prep and commercial 28-29 

Graduating class of Sacred Heart High 30-31 

Holyoke High School class of 1958, 2 lists, one boys, one girls 32-39 

St. Michael's High School senior class of 1958 40-41 

South Hadley High School Class of 1958, boys list 42 

Letter from Time Inc. re Current Affairs contest 43 

Postcards: reply re AIC; request for catalog 44 

Postcards: reminder re conference at MIT; Crusade for Freedom reply 45 

Letter from Richard Menzel re conducting a student forum to furnish 
information to students about accounting as a profession, January 3, 1951 

46 

List of projector materials and its parts 47 

Handwritten note re making of a cabinet or table by someone in Winchendon 
Springs, MA 

48 

Invoice from Springfield Audio & Electronics, Springfield for rental of 
equipment, 5/12/ 1964 

49 

Invoice from Daniel F. Waters Co., re stationary items, 5/5/ 1964 50 

Invoice from the Nixon Co., Indian Orchard, MA re purchase of sports letters 
for basketball, hockey, and baseball; 1964 

51 

Invoice: Holyoke Sporting Goods Co., for 3 Louisville slugger bats, 4/24 1964 52 

Invoice: Holyoke Sporting Goods Co., for 3 baseball bats, 5/16 1964 53 

Invoice from The Odyssey Book Shop for book about JFK, 5/9 1964 54 

Order for 17 sets of NYTI programmed course in first year college physics: 
sound and light to McGraw Hill Book Co. 

55 

Press release: registration for the second semester at HJC 56-57 

Press release: Junior College students attend convention in Boston 58-59 

3rd Annual Air Transport Conference, Sept, 10-12, 1963 in NYC notice 60 
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Letter from the State House re International Student Day 61 

Memo from the State House re International Student Day 62 

Letter from Lovejoy's College Guide to ensure the correct entry appears in the 
1964 guide 

63 

Letter from General Dynamics doing background check on an applicant,    
April 8, 1964 

64 

Selective Service System student certificate stating student is enrolled  65 

Letter from Selective Service System, Local Board no. 11, Greenfield, 
requesting information about student's status 

66 

Letter from Gail Jefferson re graduation 67 

Form letter from Nathaniel Hawthorne College requesting a student transcript , 
February 19, 1964  

68 

Invoice for tuition and textbooks for Spring 1963 69 

Letter of recommendation for student's transfer 70 

Memo re programs for returning students and for new part-time students 71 

Notice that Holyoke Junior College will be renamed Holyoke Community 
College and fall under the governance of the Mass. Board of Regional 
Community Colleges; lists the full time faculty needs; 1964 

72-73 

Letter from Robert Savary re need to take a physics course not offered at 
University of Massachusetts 

74 

Letter to Maurice Donahue re incorrectly routed letter 75 

Letters to Burton Resnic and from the same re letter which Mr. Resnic wanted 
translated from German, November 1963 

76-77 

Resume of George E. Frost 78 

Annual meeting of Mass. Hospital Association, Boston, January 26, 1951 79-80 

Mass. Hospital Association Newsletter; January 18, 1951 81 

American Society of x-ray technicians, careers circular 82 

American Registry of x-ray technicians, 1959-60 83 

Form letter from Training School for Medical Technologists 84 

Notes from Professor Richason and Mrs. Judd re medical technology 85 

Letter of conditional acceptance of teaching position 86 

Program for Conference on Action for Mental Health, May 17, 1962 87 

Information about GED tests 88 

Letter from Federal Reserve System looking for information about potential 
employee; September 26, 1950 

89 

Request for deferment for Frederick Palmer; September 1950 90 

Request to fill out questionnaire and the answers to the questionnaire 91-93 

Postcard: Business Education Conference, October 10, 1951 94 

Payroll periods for Holyoke Junior College, City of Holyoke, Superintendent of 
Schools; 1951-1952 

95 

Accident report for instructor; June 22, 1951 96 

Informal resume for Daniel Sobala 97 

List of books loaned by Mr. Cramer, Mt. Holyoke 98-99 

Resume for Mrs. Solo, graduate of Mt. Holyoke and list of references 100 

Resume for Robert Jordan 101 

Letter of acceptance for the resignation of Rudolph Kyler to University of 
Mass.; April 18, 1958 

102 

Resume of James Sheldon 103 

Resume of John Cleary 104 
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Resume of Britomar Handlon; 1958 105 

Letter from William Gates re summer classes; May 15, 1956 106 

List of names for? 107 

Letter from Veterans Administration re 'Open House Day'  November 1959 108 

National Survey of Technical Institute letter re survey & its results; Oct. 30, 
1959 

109 

65th National Conference on Government: form letter about upcoming 
conference; November 4, 1959 

110 

National Beta Club letter of "College-Facts Chart" and request to answer a 
questionnaire 

111 

Invitation to open house at University of Massachusetts, theme: Educating for 
Democracy; March 25, 1960 

112 

Letter from City of Holyoke, Mayor Samuel Resnic re Holyoke Civil War 
Centennial Committee looking to organize; 1960 

113 

Program for February meeting of A.P.G.A. at Springfield College, Feb. 6, 1960 114 

Letter from General Electric for the donation of cable to the College 115 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-07 (Old Box 95I) PAGES 

Notes about typewriter purchase 1 

Note to Misters Donoghue, Neverauskas, and O'Connell from George 
Richason re laboratory instruction or lack thereof 

2 

Personal data sheet or resume from Arthur Williams; September 1954 3 

Resume of Armand Costa 4 

Resume of Edward Larkin 5 

Note about chest x-ray examinations at Springfield College; September 1957 6 

Resume of John Eric Laestadius 7 

List of new instructors for 1957-58 8 

List of Holyoke Junior College faculty; 1957-1958 9-13 

Letter to Isadore Cohen re his employment at the College 14 

Resume of Louis Cohn-Haft; 1950s 15 

Resume of Gennaro Stabile 16 

Resume of Donald Spencer; 1950s 17 

Resume of Russell Callahan 18-19 

Classrooms in use September 20, 1951-February 1, 1952 20 

Classrooms in use September 21, 1950-February 2, 1951 21 

Letter of application as instructor of English, history & humanities from Robert 
Ehrlich; July 26, 1962 

22 

Resume of Peter Ouroussoff 23 

Form: information required of instructors, Ralph Nazzaro, Stanley Ross, Henry 
Rox 

24-26, 29 

Press release from Mount Holyoke re Henry Rox 27-28 

Form: information required of instructors: Frederick Sell 30-32 

Form: information required of instructors: Richard Sollenberger 33-34 

Form: information required of instructors: Chester Thorndike 35-36 

Form: information required of instructors: Lawrence Wallis 37 

2 pages of instructors and their credentials 38-39 

Letter from George Frost to instructors re course syllabi; 1949 40 

Biography: Stanley Ross 41 

Biography: Ellen Ellis 42-43 

Letter to Mary O'Connell, HJC, from Elizabeth Allen at School of Business 
Administration, UMass, re Edwin Schempp's background; January 18, 1952 

44 

Notes about several things: short list of speakers; instructors needed for 4 
courses; instructors who refused teaching assignments 

45-46 

Notes from Mr. Peck's phone conversation re a lab assistant, teaching staff 
pays, report cards, and school calendar 

47 

Form: listing credentials of an instructor 48 

Resume of Edward Tripp 50 

Memo to Mr. Peck from Miss Ursula Toomey re faculty for Holyoke Graduate 
School: Robert Young, Norman Mattis, James Clancey, Chester Thorndike, 
William Holmes, Frederick Cramer, Richard Johnson, Stewart Garrison, 
Marie-Jeanne Bourgoin, Frederic Sell, Melba Manero; September 22, 1946 

49, 51-56 

List of students who have withdrawn from the Junior College and students 
with great number of absences; November 24, 1958 

57 

Faculty payroll periods for 1958-1959 58 

Resume of William Durfee 59 
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Handwritten credentials of Joseph Marcus and Karl Hendrikson 60-61 

Resume of Walter Hopkins 62-63 

Resume of Lowell Edwin Lingo 64 

Resume of Herbert Lindner 65 

Resume of Mary Raissi; August 8, 1955 66 

Letter and resume of David Clark; April 30, 1955 67-69 

Resume of John Mitchell; February 28, 1955 70 

Letter from the Committee elected by the faculty of Holyoke Junior College to 
petition the School Board for an increase in salaries 

71-72 

Curriculum vitae or resume of Curtis smith; January 11, 1956 73 

Resume of prospective female instructor 74 

Financial report from Newton Junior College, July 22, 1959 75 

Memo from Mass. Advisory Committee on Science and Mathematics and 
agenda; March 21, 1960 

76-77 

Thank you letter to Joseph Kushner from Harold Hardy for talk re food broker 
in the food industry; March 21, 1960 

78 

Letter from Governor Foster Furcolo encouraging attendance citizen 
participation in the improvement and modernization of state government; 
March 28, 1960; autograph 

79 

Letter re transportation questionnaire; March 15, 1960 79 

Letter re viewing a film from Associated General Contractors in Boston for 
engineering students at the college; March 29, 1960 

80 

Letter from Gregg Publishing to the Junior College re order of textbooks; 
March 1, 1960 

81 

Letter from Walter Taylor, director, Newton Junior College, to the Joint 
Committee on Education re the public junior colleges in Mass. And their 
possible 'proliferation'; February 6, 1960 

82-83 

Conference of Presidents….of Private and Public Junior Colleges in Mass.: 
schedule and agenda; April 6, 1960 

84 

Letter to Thomas O'Connell, Mass. Board of Regional Community Colleges 
congratulating him on his appointment to heard Berkshire Community College; 
April 17, 1960 

85 

Invitation to Assumption College for special convocation in honor of Richard 
Cardinal Cushing; November 27, 1959 

86 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-08 (Old Box 95J) PAGES 

Letter re registration fee for Paul Foley; May 31, 19--? 1 

Chapter 756: the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, 1957: an act to reimburse 
cities and towns for maintaining approved extended courses of instruction 

2 

Estimates for 1956 for Junior College 3 

Form: Tax on admissions, dues, cabarets, roof gardens, etc. Sept. and Oct.: 
none; Nov.  1952: Thanksgiving Dance at Toto's tax on tickets; Feb. 1951 tax 
on 31 basketball tickets; Dec. 1950 

4-5 

Form letter from Internal Revenue Service re revenue act of 1951, free or 
reduced rate admissions, exemptions, cabaret tax; Nov. 1, 1951, tax due; Oct. 
1951, no tax; July and Aug. 1951, no tax; Nov. 1951, no tax 

6-8, 9-10, 
14 

Form letter from Dept. of the Navy re junior college graduates to enter Naval 
Aviation Cadet Training Program; October 30, 1950 

11 

Letter from Dept, of the Navy requesting list of graduates; December 18, 1950 12 

Letter from Robert Wheeler re teaching English at Junior College; July 1, 1959 13 

Questionnaire about a library, not filled in 15-16 

Meeting of the National Commission on Accrediting; January 8, 1952; invoice 
indicated payment of dues 

17-18 

Letter from Ruth Moxom requesting information for son about to be released 
from active duty in Army Reserves; July 18, 1960 

19 

Letter from McIntyre, Inc. requesting list of students for research work for the 
Reader's Digest; November 1, 1952 

20 

Letter to Ann McKenna re an inquiry, September 18, no year 21 

Form: Notification of availability to teach at HJC for fall term, 1962-63 from: 
Stephen Allen, Milton Birnbaum, Irwin Boak, William Bosworth, Joshua 
Buckwold, Richard Burns, Russell Callahan, John Cleary, Isadore Cohen, 
Frederick Conlin, H. Corbin, Armand Costa, Morgan Dowd, Ann Doyle, Robert 
Drew-Bear, John Foley, S. L. Garrison, Albert Genua, Edwin Gere, Wallace 
Goldstein, Thomas Grow, William Halm, Walter Halpin, David Haskell, R. 
Hermond, Lester Hirsch, Lee Holt, S. Koehlar, K. Kroner, Anthony Krzystofik, 
Warren Kudner, R. H. Kyler, George Levy, Albert Madeira, Britton McCabe, 
John Mitchell, John Moriarty, Albert Nelson, Edward O'Malley, Joseph Perez, 
George Richason, Nicholas Russo, John Sbrega, James Sheldon, Robert 
Smith, Harold Smith, R. T. Sollenberger, Marion Sonnenfield [declines], 
Donald Spencer, John Spencer, Edmund Stawiecki, Eleanor Titcomb, John 
Tyler, H. Leland Varley, Edward Welch, Arthur Williams, Kenneth Wright, O. T. 
Zajicek, Edward Zane, John Burk, Morrison Ferrier,  Mitchell Kuzdzal, David 
Lewis, Henry Michalewicz, Noreen Moriarty, Alphonse Plaza, Allan Richards, 
R. B. Tillinghast, J. Kenneth Taylor, Horace Corbin, Edmund Nevirouskas 

22-91, 93, 
95-96 

List of faculty names 92 

Letter from Marie Held inquiring about a student 94 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-09 (Old Box 95K) PAGES 

Form letter to Members of Mayor's advisory committee on youth guidance 
from Mrs. John Hazen, Chair, re supervision of boys and girls 

1 

Form letter from Boston University re transfer of junior college students; and 
list of courses of study 

2-3 

Letter from the Travelers Insurance re opportunities for college graduates 4 

Workshop for community-junior colleges; August 3-14, 1959 5 

Mount Holyoke Institute on the United Nations: Towards a world community; 
June 25-July 22, 1950 

6 

Holyoke Visiting Nurse Assoc. annual meeting; January 16, 1950 7 
 

United Nations' Universal Declaration of human rights; July 1949 8 

National Association of Secondary School Principals, acknowledgement of 
dues paid; 2 dated receipts for donations to Holyoke Community Chest {now 
United Way}, October and November 1949 

9 

Federal Security Agency  re the building or rehabilitation of buildings for use 
as student housing; April 7, 1950 

10 

Letter checking out the attendance and character of a former student; October 
14, 19?? 

11 

Receipt from Holyoke Community Chest for receipt of money; Nov. 2, 1949 12 

Carbon copy of letter from United States Post Office and the Postmaster re 
Christmas greeting cards and the proper way to mail them 

13-14 

Invitation to Holyoke Community Nursing Council annual meeting, guest 
speaker: Hazel Bowles; May 13, 1952 

15 

Letter from lawyers Bacon, Weltman & Cohen re bankruptcy of Springfield 
Medical Supply Co.; June 30. 1952 

16 

Advisory Board Meeting Minutes for October 7, 1965; addresses high school 
renovations, bookkeeping deficiencies, enrollment numbers 

17-18 

Schedule of classes and their instructors for second semester, Feb. 1948 at 
Holyoke Junior College; costs 

19 

List of people: Administrative officers of the Holyoke Junior College, Advisory 
Committee of the Holyoke Junior College and the member of the Committee 
on University extension of the Connecticut Valley ollege 

20 

Data sheet or resume of Lucien J. Theriault 21 

Revised list of prospective candidates for graduation; June 1960 22 

List of professional activities, speaking engagements, list of professional 
associations; instructor not known 

23-24 

Note re gambling vote coming in November; undated 25 

Questionnaire on Long Range planning for institutions of higher education, not 
filled out; pre 1968 

26 

Handwritten note from Lois Stearns re course in German; July 15, 1953 27, 37 

Help to write letters of reference 28 

Requisitions for science supplies at Holyoke Junior College; January  31, 1958 29 

2 postcards: questionnaire reply requested, and info re potential student? 30 

State surplus sheet: Mosler safe requested by Holyoke Trade School; 10/30 
1962 

31 

Letter form Internal Revenue Service re surplus property; October 25, 1962 32 

Letter from W. B. Saunders, publishers, re shipment of books and 33 
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discrepancies on the list; May 25, 1962 

Invoice from International Medical  Instrument Corp. re purchase of 
microscopes; 11/27 1962 

34 

Invoice for scientific equipment: Chain-o-matic from Will Corp. Rochester, NY; 
December 4, 1959 

35 

Letter from pastor Sacred Heart High School re marks of high school grads 
now attending the college; February 23, 1955 

36 

Letter from South-Western Publishing re updating list of faculty so they can 
receive important mailings; July 1, 1953 

38 

Letter from Scott, Foresman re book order; September 17, 1958 39 

Letter from Public Schools of Springfield, Bureau of Adult Education and Pupil 
Services re application for federal funds; October 20, 1958 

40 

Letter to James Ludtke from Frank Cavanagh re self-employment tax for part 
time faculty member; and an additional letter re salary vs. professional fees, 
May 9, 1958 

41, 84 

Notice to Principals and Teachers from the Superintendent of Schools, William 
Peck re opening of schools, sessions, ages, birth certificates, non-resident 
pupils, school buses, food service, Eastern States, Jewish holy days, 
meetings, fire drills, accident insurance, enrollment reports, open positions 
including one for the Junior College basketball team; August 29. 1958  

42-44 

Letter from South-Western Publishing re update of mailing list; June 21, 1951 45 

List of summer schools, 3 Boston, 1 Cambridge, 1 Worcester, for veterans 46 

Letter from South Hadley High School requesting ad space in its yearbook; 
October 5, 1949 

47 

Letter from Springfield College to Henry Fitzpatrick, Principal, Holyoke High 
School, re Dr. Limbert's absence 

48 

Original  notes about the history of Holyoke Community College in 1946, do 
not know the source 

49 

Note about enrollment capacity; 1958-1959 50 

Page 2 of a letter from Rogers Rusk from Greenville, SC 51 

Letter from Providence Hospital re job opening; April 9, 1959 52-53 

Letter from Blanchette…requesting courses for medical secretary 54 

Invoice re shipment of science supplies 55-57 

Personal data, resume, for Russell Harrington, Henry Varley, Joseph Perez, 
Georges Chedin, German del Rio Setien 

58-62, 88 

Transcript from University of Conn. For Joseph Perez 63-64 

Personal data, resume, for John O'Brien, Harrison Cameron, 65, 68-71 

Transcript from University of Mass., Amherst., for Joseph Perez 66 

Form from George Frost informing an instructor about his/her teaching 
assignment; May 24, 1961 

67 

Request for transcript 72 

List of faculty for 1951-1952 73-74 

List of faculty for 1950-1951 75-78 

List of faculty 79-82 

Letter from doctor re chest x-ray for Britomar Handlon, October 14, 1958 83 

List of science needs from Kenneth Wright 85 

Letter of reference for Merton Brown 86 

Note of thanks to Ellen Lynch from Ellen Ellis  87 

Contributions to Cramer Memorial Fund  89 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-10 (Old Box 95L) PAGES 

Items pertaining to Traffic Management course: Traffic Club of Springfield 
roster, 1956-57; list of students?; application for the course 

1-5, 9 

List of persons enrolled in Traffic Management course on Monday and 
Wednesday  

6-7 

Traffic Management course description and outline; 1957 8, 66 

Holyoke Junior College receipts for payment of tuition: William Young, 
Frederick Eastman, Earle Richardson, Phyllis Hollinghurst,  

10 

Paul Laflamme, Edwin O'Connor, John Kelly, Frank Mastalerz,  11 

Malcolm Tinker, Bernard Mill, Mildred Seems, B. Irene Botalho,  12 

Edward Hellyer, Patrick Hennessey, Frank Cole. William Curran, 13 

Earle Richardson, Robert Wilson, Arthur Leduc, 14 

Rene Peloquin, Amelia Rancourt, N. Stuart Reynolds, 15 

Helen Dempsey, Frank Mastalerz, Mildred Dietz, 16 

John Miller, Clifford Murphy, Bernard O'Neill, 17 

Norman Klaucke, Roger Keble, Pesis Giovanelli, 18 

Francis Duff, Henry Gareau, Clarence Giovanelli, 19 

Raymond Costello, James Cronin, James Davis, 20 

Malcolm Tinker, Richard Carleton, Douglas Cochrane, 21 

Patrick Hennessey, John Kelly, Herman Shore 22 

Remittance statements from various employers for their employees to attend 
the Traffic Management course 

23-25 

First annual conference sponsored by Holyoke Junior College and Holyoke 
Chamber of Commerce: Frontiers in industrial traffic management; April 20, 
1960 

26-29 

Applications for Traffic Management course: Jerome Hennessey, Malcolm 
Tinker, John Kelly, Richard Sarleton, 

30-33 

Howard Thompson, James Knightly, William Bacis, 34-36 

Armand Larocome, Frank Mastalerz, Philip Blanchard, Roger Kaeble, 37-40 

Amelia Rancourt, Thomas Mahoney, John Bardon, Robert White, 41-44 

N. Stuart Reynolds, Percy Roberts, Donald Rix, Arthur Leduc, 45-48 

Clifford Murphy, Herman Shore, John Falvey, Earle Richardson, Everett 
Horne, Paul Laflamme 

49-54 

Handwritten list of people enrolling in Basic Traffic Management 55-56 

Thank you letter to National Blank Book Co. for allowing the students to do a 
traffic survey of the plant; and the survey 

57-61 

Textbooks for Basic Traffic from Traffic World; September 1, 1959 62 

Letter from Traffic Managers' Institute to R. S. Callahan re curriculum 63 

Handwritten note with jottings about the Traffic course 64-65 

Carbon copy of letter to Fran Riley of MacColl-Riley from R. S. Callahan on 
the occasion of the 1st annual Traffic Conference; April 22, 1960 

67 

Bulletin #4 from the director re spring recess, faculty meeting, finals, 
commencement, grades, graduates, economics in action, fire drill, and some 
do's and don'ts; March 23 1964 

68-69 

Schedule of events for the opening of classes for the spring semester 1964 70 

Subscription form for Data Processing for Education 71 

Handwritten list of items needed for a chemistry class 72-73 

Invoice for shipment of books for zoology; January 21, 1964 74 

Letter from Bruce Publishing sending desk copy to instructor; July 30, 1963 75 
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Blank order form for intelligence tests 76 

List of items needed for a class or an instructor 77 

Invoice from Burns Co., for a doctor's cap and gown 78 

Invoice for biology supplies 79 

Supplies ordered from Connecticut Valley Biological Supply, February 1964 80 

Invoice from Holyoke Sporting Goods for a baseball and baseball caps; 4/20 
1964 

81 

Invoice from Springfield College for lab manuals; March 27, 1964 82 

Invoice from Holyoke Sporting Goods for a baseball and baseball bats; April 
11, 1964 

83 

Bill from South Street Millwork and Lumber, Holyoke; April 30, 1964 84 

Invoice from Forbes Snyder, Holyoke, for supplies; April 10, 1964 85 

Invoice from Boston University for film rental; January 15, 1964 86 

Letter from Springfield College re credit balance for lab manuals; April 6, 1964 87 

Resume of …Holleran 88-90 

Bill for 1 dictionary; July 23, 1952 91 

Letter from someone at Westfield State College re teaching at the junior 
college 

92 

Letter from George Gibian at Smith College to teach part time at the junior 
college; April 26, 1952 

93 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-11 (Old Box 95M) PAGES 

Invoice from Pease-Buchholz Costume Co., Springfield, for  Drama Club 
cosmetics; April 28, 1964 

1 

Letter from America Society of Clinical Pathologists re schools offering 
medical technology courses; February 11, 1960 

2 

Letter from William Starkweather, Registrar, University of Massachusetts, to 
Dean Robertson re transfer of students in the medical technology program; 
May 14, 1964 

3 

List of approved schools of x-ray technology from the Council on Medical 
Education and Hospitals of the American Medical Assoc.; November 14, 1959 

4-7 

Letter from Boston Chamber of Commerce re Research Day, implemented 
research results in new and better products and jobs; April 9, 1952 

8 

United States Post Office in Holyoke sends letter re Christmas greeting cards 
regulations 

8-9 

Resume of James Ludtke; list of books used with specific courses 10-12, 13-
15 

School of nursing committee meeting agenda; January 22, 1951 16 

Notice of Holyoke Community Nursing Council annual meeting at Providence 
Hospital; May 9, 1951 

17 

Postcard from Jane Gravany seeking admission to Junior College; 1953.  
Blank registration card for Holyoke Junior College 

18 

Blank cards: 1 is registration card for students; and one is information required 
of instructors 

19 

Handwritten inventory sheets; 11-21 1958 20,21,23 

Blank sheet of letterhead paper from the Office of the Director, Holyoke Junior 
College 

22 

List of students withdrawing from college and list of students not to be 
admitted to class 

24 

Application blank to Holyoke Junior College; 1950-59? 25 

Handwritten list of graduation needs for 1963 26 

Handwritten list of printing inventory supplies; November 1, 1962 27-28 

Handwritten list of the December payroll 29 

Mimeographed withdrawal form from Dean Robertson 30 

Blank sheet of notepaper from the desk of: Victor Thomas, Director of 
Admissions.  Blank course schedule for a student. 

31 

Blank class card or grade card for student's quarterly course grade; 196- 
Blank invoice from Business Manager for student charges 

32 

Inaugural Chapel exercises for the Holyoke Graduate School; September 30, 
1946 

33 

Bulletin #1 for faculty from the Director re fire drill, class registration, course 
cards, attendance, classrooms, salary payments, faculty absences,  student 
progress, class schedule; budget for 1962; faculty meetings, no school 
signals, books and equipment, parking; 1961 

34-35 

Directory of associations, clubs and organizations from the Holyoke Chamber 
of Commerce and when some of them meet 

36-40 

Letter from Northampton High School requesting application blanks; June 8, 
1953  

41 

Holyoke Junior College payroll periods; 1957-1958 42 
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Holyoke Junior College faculty payroll periods; 1957-1958 43 

Monthly faculty payroll for 1957-1958; lab instructors and library pay roll (page 
2 of each month) 

44-57 

Fall enrollment figures for years 1954-1963 and handwritten copy 58-59 

Laboratory schedule for Chemistry 101 for 1964-1964 60 

Eleventh commencement exercises program for Holyoke Junior College, June 
6, 1958 

61 

Typewritten list of names with addresses and phone numbers handwritten; old 
style because phone numbers are just 5 numbers 

62 

Handwritten thank you letter from Delia Jane…to Holyoke Junior College 
Alumni Association for receipt of scholarship money; September 17, 1956 

63 

Handwritten note dated April 2, 1956 thanking Dr. Frost for the help he and 
the college gave him; water damaged 

64 

Letter from Edward Kennedy seeking transcript for admission to Columbia 
University and Boston University; March 21, 1956 

65 

Letter from George Frost to Alumni inviting them to attend a buffet supper at 
the Holyoke High School Cafeteria on  November 16, 1955; October 26, 1955 

66 

Letter to Alumnus listing many accomplishments of the College: library growth, 
The Chief, The Latchkey, Drama Club, athletic program; inviting alumni to 
attend 10th anniversary party in June; March 21, 1956 

67-68 

Special 10th anniversary bulletin from the celebration committee chairman, 
Maurice Ferriter, in support of the Holyoke Junior College celebration to be 
held at Roger Smith Hotel on June 2,1956 

69-70 

Notice of the annual meeting of the Holyoke chapter, National Conference of 
Christians and Jews; June 18, 1962 

71 

List of Directors and Officers for the year 1961-1962, National Conference of 
Christians and Jews; list of Committees; schedule of director meetings; 
budget; letter and agenda for meeting October 24 

72-77 

Reservation blank for New England Junior College Council meeting, 
December 10, 1955; tentative program for annual meeting; New England 
Junior College Council members and officers 

78-81 

Postcard: to the Registrar from Stanley Salwak re doctorate dissertation 
information request; December 3, 1952 

82 

List of the members of the Holyoke Graduate School faculty; 1946 83 

Partial list of faculty (no date, perhaps 1948-1949) 84, 88 

Holyoke Junior College schedule of classes for 1948-1949 85, 87 

Handwritten list with 3 names, possible instructors? 86 

Typewritten list of instructors, partial list 89, 101 

Handwritten schedule of classes, times, and instructors 90 

List of instructors for 1949-1950 91-92 

Holyoke Junior College faculty: 1947-1948 93-95 

Holyoke Junior College schedule of classes for 1947-1948 96-97 

Faculty of Holyoke Graduate School; October 31, 1946 99 

Mater Dolorosa communion breakfast, portion of speech 100 

Westfield Trade high school graduation,  portion of speech, typewritten 102 

Westfield Trade high school graduation, handwritten speech 103-113 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-12 (Old Box 95N) PAGES 

This box contains several documents relative to the formation of state 
regulated community or junior colleges 

 

Statute: Acts and Resolves, 1966, chapter 210: an act relative to the salaries 
of certain officers and employees of the Commonwealth 

1 

Carbon copy list of instructors and their credentials, faculty 2-3 

Letter from James Burke, Department of Education, re changes in course 
offerings for veterans; May 23, 1960 

4 

Lists of instructors and their credentials, qualifications, undated 5-10,18- 

Application from Board of Collegiate Authority, Dept. of Education [filled out]; 
October 7, 1964 

11-13, 21-
23 

Blank form for list of instructors 14-16 

List of faculty resignations, retirements removed from Joint Directory of Higher 
Education 

15 

List of faculty additions to Joint Directory of Higher Education 17 

Higher education for American democracy: vol. 1: establishing the goals, a 
report of the President's Commission on Higher Education, Washington, 
December 1947, chapter IV: Education Adjusted to Needs: the Community 
College, pages 67-68 

24, 29 

Second report to the President: the President's Committee on Education 
beyond the high school: summary report, July 1957; expansion and diversity 
of educational opportunities, the need for planning 

25,30,74,76 

The State and Education 1955, U.S. Dept. of Health, Education, and Welfare: 
Public junior or community colleges; The junior college district 

26, 31 

State Government April 1957: yardsticks for a public junior colleges 27,32,72,73 

Basic functions of community colleges: the community-junior-college concept, 
taken from Junior College Terminal Education in your community by L. L. 
Bethel and F. B. Lindsay 

28, 33 

Bibliography of junior college articles 34 

List of alumni, not necessarily graduates, of Holyoke Junior College from 
1946-1951 

35-41 

List of rooms used by junior college (in the Holyoke High School) 42-43 

Letter from Stanley Salwak, University of Massachusetts, re establishment of 
public junior colleges, July 10, 19--, and enclosures: map, rating sheets 

44-47 

Page 2 of a questionnaire re junior college: physical facilities, library 48 

Program from Worcester Junior College, 50th anniversary student reception; 
December 4, 1955 

49 

Commonwealth of Massachusetts: Preliminary report of the special 
commission relative to the operation and structure of junior college in the 
Commonwealth; December 31, 1956     Some captions: present law governing 
junior and community colleges; specialized technical training for future 
students; proposed branch coop training program at Pittsfield between GE 
and UMass; pioneer study on junior colleges made in Mass.; general 
statement of UMass position re junior or community college problem. Statute 
or law 

50-55 

Section 78, Chapter 71, of the law of the General Court is hereby amended to 
read as follows: (typewritten copy) (undated) and its copy 

56-57, 68, 
70, 71 

Chapter 756: an act to reimburse cities and towns for maintaining approved 
extended courses of instruction; by Mr. Lee of Quincy; 1957. Statute or law 

58 
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Holyoke Junior College: special adult program in community services offered 
by the junior college: Great Books course; Certified Professional Secretaries' 
Examination; science for schools of nursing; terminal basic engineering and 
business administration;  National Conference of Christians and Jews; labor 
relations; traffic management course; October 1957 

59-60 

Commonwealth of Massachusetts, 1957, an act relating to degrees conferred 
by state community colleges, House no 1521.  Statute or law. 

61 

Commonwealth of Massachusetts, 1957, an act establishing community 
colleges in the state of Massachusetts and to declare their purpose and 
function; and to provide for the personnel of the community college 
commission and to define their powers and duties and for other related 
purposes, House no. 321 Statute or law. 

62-63 

Commonwealth of Massachusetts, 1957, an act creating and establishing 
junior colleges under the management and control of the Board of Trustees of 
the University of Massachusetts, House no. 479.  Statute or law 

64-65 

Commonwealth of Massachusetts, December 31, 1956: Preliminary report of 
the special commission relative to the operation and structure of junior 
colleges in the Commonwealth,  House no. 2850 (24 pages)  

66-67 

Holyoke Junior College - re: encouraging graduates of the high school to 
attend the junior college and transfer to senior colleges 

69 

Resume for Edward Stentaford 77 

Resume for Howard Brogan 78 

Press release re Warren Kudner to coordinate course for secretaries; 1957? 79 

Resume for Warren Kudner 80 

Holyoke Junior College announces second semester courses; February 5, 
1951 

81 

Resume of Dorothy Bell 82 

Press release from AIC re Leo Parente and faculty appointment; resume 83-84,86-87 

Resume of John Tyler 85,88 

Resume of Simone Deitz 89 

Resume of M. St. Claire 90 

Resume of George Frost 91 
 

 

Additional information including the statutes/laws re community colleges in the 
Commonwealth is available in 16.04-01 (Old Box 86B) 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-13 (Old Box 95O) PAGES 

Item re Pen and Palette, photo, and article describing the publication 
(probably from a yearbook) 

1 

Press release re Pen and Palette issued at Holyoke Junior College 2 

Letter to J. F. Mahoney, Seal Engravers, Weymouth, from Paul Mitman re 
changes in the seal of Holyoke Community College formerly Holyoke Junior 
College, the seal remained the same except for the word Junior and the dates; 
July 23, 1964 

3 

Letter from J. F. Mahoney to Paul Mitman in response to Mr. Mitman's inquiry; 
July 25, 1964 

4 

Letter to Hoffman Seal, Stamp and Engraving Co., Boston, with same request 
as page #3; August 4, 1964 

5 

Letter from Hoffman Seal etc. with new quote; August 6, 1964 6 

Letter to Hoffman Seal etc. for new bid and quote; August 7, 1964 7 

2 notes, one that the seal is on the top shelf in a metal cabinet and one that 
something was loaned to Dominican Nuns of West Springfield 

8 

Handwritten address for Hoffman Seal, etc. 9 

Copies of the Holyoke Junior College seal 10-11 

Standing of class of 1957, 75 students [document on which the honor roll is 
based?] 

12 

List of students eligible to graduate in June 1963? 13 

Typewritten list of Holyoke Junior College class officers for 1948, 1949, 1950, 
1951, 1952, 1953, 1954, 1955 and list of Alumni association officers: 1948, 
1952, 1953, 1954 

14-15 

Mimeograph sheets of class officers from 1948 to 1960 16-17 

Ballot for freshman class officers, school year 1961-62 with totals for each 
office 

18-20 

Ballot for student council sophomore elections with totals for each person 21 

Student council members for second semester, not dated 22 

Long list of books to go on reserve shelf in the library for a political science 
course from instructor Ellen Ellis; 1953-1954 

23 

List of periodicals and newspapers available in the junior college library from 
E. MacCarthy, Librarian, May 11, 19-- 

24 

Letter from Sister Juliana to E. MacCarthy in response to her letter for 
information about the combined library of a high school with junior college, 
enclosure of page from Sister's thesis on the subject; April 20, 1958 

25-26 

Schedule of library assistants for the school year 1957-1958 27 

2 pages from the Massachusetts Division of Library Extension, Boston, with 
suggestions for interfiling catalogs of book collections of Holyoke High School 
and Holyoke Junior College and suggestions and recommendations from the 
Library Extension which might prove helpful for accreditation; Dec. 17, 1959 

28-29 

List of library student monitors for 1963-1964, both semesters 30-31 

Holyoke Junior College receipts and expenditures, 1949-1950 32 

List of tuition fees, registration fees, and book money received or taken in; 
graduation fees 

33-34 

Report of statistics sent to American Association of Junior Colleges in 1949 35 

Enrollment figures for 1949-50 and 1950-51, handwritten list 36 

Questionnaire from Federal Security Agency for FY 1950, filled in 37-45 
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Report sent to World Almanac questionnaire, enrollment, instructors, costs; 
April 25, 1951 

46 

Reply to query from George Frost to the New York Times; October 13, 1950 47 

Memo from New York Times reminder about questionnaire, October 11, 1950 48 

New York Times Survey on enrollment trends; October 11, 1950 49-53 

Letter from American Council on Education to George Frost re American 
Junior College reference book; June 1, 1951 

54 

Mailing list from Association of American University Presses needs updating 
with faculty help 

55-56 

American Association of Junior Colleges letter to Holyoke Junior College re 
new directory 

57 

Letter from the New York Times re an education article and filling out a 
questionnaire; September 27, 1950; and questionnaire; another letter 

58,96-100, 
104 

Questionnaire with completed information for the 1951 junior college directory 59-62 

Letter from the Federal Security Agency re enrollment information; September 
18, 1951 

63-65 

Letter from George Frost to Lovejoy's re entry for a college guide; January 16, 
1952 

66-69 

Questionnaire for American Junior Colleges for 1952 70-78 

Letter from Wilcox & Follett book company re college bulletin; December 27, 
1951 

79 

Questionnaire for American Junior Colleges for 1948 80-87 

Letter to Superintendent of Holyoke Schools, William Peck, from George Frost 
re enrollment at the junior college; 1949-1951 and 1952 

88-89 

Letter from Federal Security Agency requesting fall enrollment figures; 
September 18, 1952 

90-93 

Postcards: to George Frost from American Association of Junior Colleges re 
enrollment figures, 1951, and to Federal Security Agency re survey of fall 
enrollment, 1952 

94 

Another letter from Federal Security Agency re enrollment, May 1952 95 

Holyoke Junior College comparative financial statistics from 1947-1956 101-102, 
105-106 

Enrollment figures from 1946-1953, including nurses 103 

Massachusetts League for Nursing, conference on nursing education in 
community colleges at Newton Junior College; November 1, 1962 program 

107-110 

Letter from Welch Manufacturing re the cancellation of a portion of an order; 
November 28, 1947 

111 

Letter from Welch Manufacturing re a catalog on file; February 12, 1947 112 

Letter from Central Scientific Company to S. A. Brunelle, acting director, 
Holyoke Graduate School, re replacement of item broken during shipment; 
November 27, 1946 

113 

Letter from Sheldon Transfer and Storage re a shipment; December 1, 1948 114 

Letter from Welch Manufacturing re confirming order and shipment of items for 
physics class; August 15, 1947 

115 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-14 (Old Box 95P) PAGES 

Accreditation items from the 1950s and 1960s  

National Commission on Accrediting: minutes of meeting in Chicago; March 
28, 1953 

1-8 

Financial state of said Commission 8 

Evaluation and accreditation in the Middle States; Association of Colleges and 
Secondary Schools 

9-17 

Policy statement; letter re policy statement 18-19 

Invoice for membership in the National Commission on Accrediting September 
1954 - August 1955 

20 

Note from the Commission acknowledging membership dues receipt, October 
1, 1954 

21 

Enrollment figures from 1946-1958 and numbers of instructors 22-23 

Report to presidents of institutional members from National Council on 
Accrediting; October 1958 

24-28 

Handwritten list with enrollment figures 29 

National Commission on Accrediting: present status of accrediting in higher 
education, booklet, 1960; letter explaining significance of speech in booklet 

30-32,33-36 

Report to presidents of institutional members from National Council on 
Accrediting; January 6, 1960 

37-38 

National Commission on Accrediting newsletter, January 1961 39-41 

Information relating to NCATE accreditation; May 8, 1961 42-52 

National Commission on Accrediting newsletter, May 1961 53-55 

Accreditation of junior colleges by specialized or professional agencies, 
January 15, 1962 

56-61 

National Commission on Accrediting newsletter, December 1961 62-64 

National Commission on Accrediting newsletter; October 1961 65-66 

Accreditation of programs in teacher education 67 

Letter to George Frost from Morgan Dowd, University of Massachusetts re 
invitation to discuss philosophy of community colleges; October 22, 1962 

68 

Instructors for 1949-1950, names, addresses, salaries 69-72 

List of faculty at Holyoke Junior College 73-75 

Letter from George Frost to William Peck re expenditures for the academic 
year 1949-1950: capital outlay for repairs and furniture for the student lounge; 
library reference books purchase; December 1, 1948 

76 

Holyoke Junior College faculty school year 1953-1954, mimeographed copy 77-82 

Holyoke Junior College faculty school year 1954-1955, mimeographed copy 83-85 

Enrollment figures, full and part time students; 1959-1960 86 

Numbers of faculty for 1957 87 

Blank forms: qualifications for teachers, degrees, subjects now teaching, full 
or part time 

88 

List of curricula offered at Holyoke Junior College, percentage of transfer 
students and terminal students; 3/26 1958 

89 

Estimates for 1956 for junior college; salaries, maintenance, expenditures FY 
1956, profit to city of Holyoke 

90 

Junior College enrollment statistics from 1947-1955; tuition and fees for 
University of Massachusetts and Westfield State Teachers College, 1955-
1956 

91-92 



DOCUMENTS SAVED FROM 1968 FIRE 
(Fire Archives 1946-1963) 

 

 30 

Geographical distribution of freshmen and sophomores, male and female, full 
and part time, number of veterans, numbers of students in various curricula; 
1956-1957 

93-94 

Memo re enrollment, instructors; May 2, 1958 95 

Letter from Hamilton Standard, A. J. Fehlber to William Lennon in Agawam re 
training program in mechanical drawing; September 17, 1956 

96 

Resume of Robert Drew-Bear 97-98 

Holyoke Junior College faculty school year 1956-1957 99-103 

Brief resume for William Lennon 104 

Letter from Joseph Houser, Westfield State Sanatorium, to Ernest Radcliffe, 
University of Massachusetts, re chest x-ray; September 26, 1956 

105 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-15 (Old Box 95Q) PAGES 

Holyoke Graduate School, special notice to students and instructors to be 
read in every class: honor roll, deficiencies, grading system, absenteeism, 
punctuality, conduct, standards, student organizations, Christmas greeting; 
from William Peck, Superintendent of Schools; September 9, 1946 

1-2 

Holyoke Junior College director's honor roll for final grades, 1946-1947; 
director's honor list 

3-5,7 

Director's honor roll, 1947 6 

Handwritten list for honor roll 8 

Director's honor roll; 1947-1948 9 

First semester director's honor roll; 1946-1947 10 

Director's honor roll 1947-1948 11 

Director's honor roll 1953 12 

Director's honor roll for first semester, 1947-1948 13 

Letter from Holyoke Graduate School to William Peck from S. A. Brunelle, 
acting director, re possible honor roll 

14 

Director's honor roll for 3rd quarter, 1948 15 

Press release re Director's honor roll 16 

Director's honor roll for 1st quarter 1948 17 

Director's honor roll for 1st semester 1948-1949 18-19 

Press release re Director's honor roll 20 

Director's honor roll for 3rd quarter 1948-1949 21-22 

Director's honor roll for 4th quarter 1949 23-24 

Director's honor roll for 1st quarter 1949 25-26 

Director's honor roll for 1st semester 1950 27-28 

Handwritten note re GI refunds and note to superintendent 29 

List of GI students entitled to reimbursement of $10 registration fee 30 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1958 31-34 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1957 35-36 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1957 37-38 

Handwritten Director's honor roll list 39-40 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1956 41-42 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1957 43-44 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 45-47 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1956 48-49 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1956, page 2 50-51 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1955 52 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 53-54 

Director's honor roll, 1955 55 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 56-57 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1959 58-62 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1959 63-64 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 66-67 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1959 68-69 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1959 70-71,74-75 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1958 72-73 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1957 76-78 

Director's honor roll, 2nd semester, 1953 79-80 
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Director's honor roll, handwritten list for 1953 81 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1953 82 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1952 83-86 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1952 87-89 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1951 90 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1952 91 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1951 92 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1950 93 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 94 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1953 95 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1955 96 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1955 97-98 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1956 99-100 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1956 101-103 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 104-106 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1955 107-108 

Director's honor roll, handwritten, 4th quarter 109-110 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1955 111-112 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 113 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1954 114-115 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1954 116-117 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 118 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1954 119-120 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list, 4th quarter 121-122 

Director's honor roll, 3rd quarter, 1954 123-124 

Director's honor roll, handwritten list 125-127 

Director's honor roll, 1st semester, 1953 128-134 

Director's honor roll, 1st quarter, 1953 135 

Director's honor roll, 4th quarter, 1959 136-138 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-16 (Old Box 95R) PAGES 

Holyoke Junior College notice to laboratory instructors 1 

List of Holyoke Junior College faculty, 1956-1957 2-6 

Faculty changes for 2nd semester, 1958: instructors returning and new 
instructors; January 13, 1958 

7 

List of people in the Massachusetts State Senate and House of 
Representatives 

8-9 

Agenda for the 2nd quarterly meeting; in the library of Holyoke Community 
College, South Street; January 17, 1966 

10 

Suggested courses for 2 year technology curriculum; course descriptions 11-18 

Canceled check to Center for the Study of Democratic Institute, September 
22, 1964; and an invoice? 

19 

List of people who work at the college: library, athletics,  student aids, 
substitutes, guidance 

20-24 

Supplies or inventory list 25-26,28 

Changes in part time faculty 27 

National Commission on Accrediting: annual report of the executive secretary, 
March 1, 1958 

29-31 

National Commission on Accrediting: membership list and constitution, May 
1956 

32-39 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re report of progress made by 
regional accrediting associations; and the second report of progress of 
regional associations with regard to the program of the National Commission 
on Accrediting 

40-45 

Letter from the Commission on Accreditation of… re a new directory aimed at 
recently discharged military personnel; February 4, 1953 

46-47 

National convention discussion groups, junior and community colleges 48 

Program letters no. 4 re AAUW and 3 re policy statement from National 
Commission on Accrediting 

49-53 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re report to presidents of 
member institutions; May 31, 1956; January 25, 1956 

54-57 

Letter from the National Commission on Accrediting re annual meeting; March 
28, 1955 

58-59 

Letter from the National Commission on Accrediting re attached report of the 
action of the executive committee of the NCA with regard to the National 
Council for Accreditation of Teacher Education; January 31, 1955 

60-63 

Members of institutions offering programs of study accredited by professional 
associations recognized by National Commission on Accrediting 

64-65 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of institutional 
members; October 17, 1956; and list of regional and professional accrediting 
associations recognized the NCA; October 10, 1956 

66-69 

Copy of resolution adopted by the executive committee of the NCA, October 
10, 1956 re the National Council for Accreditation of Teacher Education 

69-70 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of member 
institutions; March 7, 1956 

71 

Statement re the National Council for Accreditation of Teacher Education 72-73 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of member 
institutions; February 20, 1956 

74-75 
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Statement re NCATE adopted by the Association of Teacher Education 
Institutions: February 16, 1956 

76 

Newsletter from …on Accreditation of Service Experiences, May 1959 78-83 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of member 
institutions; March 17, 1958 

84-87 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of member 
institutions; March 1959 

88-92 

National Commission on Accrediting: report to presidents of colleges and 
universities 

93 

National Commission on Accrediting: financial report for the FY ended August 
31, 1959 

94-95 

National Commission on Accrediting: statement of criteria for recognized 
accrediting agencies 

96-98 

Letter from Boston College Law School re student's admission to the college; 
August 23, 1949 

99 

Letter from George Frost to Board of Bar Examiners re student's desire to 
transfer to Boston College Law School; addresses accreditation and 
recognition factors 

100-101 

List of professional associations 102 

Comparison enrollment and faculty figures of the Holyoke Junior College from 
1948-1958 

103 

Letter from New England Association of collegiate Registrars and Admissions 
Officers to members of NEACRAO re free mailing and the report of the 
national meeting; July 10, 1953 

104-106 

Letter to George Frost from Ed Gere, Bureau of Government Research, 
University of Massachusetts re university extension bill; 1/30 1961. Enclosure: 
An act authorizing and directing the division of university extension in the 
Department of Education to establish therein a college to give credits for 
courses completed therein and to confer degrees, 1961 

107-111 

Article about the National Commission on Accrediting by Cloyd Marvin, 
president, George Washington University 

112-117 

New England Association of Colleges and Secondary Schools: constitution 118-120 

Resume of minutes of the meeting of the National Commission on Accrediting; 
June 30, 1952 

121-126 

Receipt for dues from National Commission on Accrediting; 1951 127 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-17 (Old Box 95S) PAGES 

Resume for George Frost 1-5 

Letter from Holy Cross College to Alumni re a varsity club meeting 6 

National Commission on Accrediting, constitution and by-laws; 1950 7-9 

Letter from George Frost to James Burke, Board of Collegiate Authority, re 
application for re-certification 

10 

Extract from public law 550, 82nd Congress, Chapter 875, H.R. 7656, to 
provide vocational readjustment and to restore lost educational opportunities 
to certain persons who served in the Armed Forces on or after June 27, 1950 

11-12 

Letter from James Burke to Holyoke Junior College re request to train 
veterans under public law 550    

13 

Report of the executive committee as amended and adopted by the National 
Commission on Accrediting 

14-17 

National Commission on Accrediting: estimated budget 1952-1953 18 

National Commission on Accrediting: statement of income and expense 1950-
1952 

19 

Letter from George Frost to James Burke re new certification of the Junior 
College to provide education for veterans under public law 550; also refers to 
public law 346 which enabled the junior college to begin in 1946; Aug. 26, 
1952 

20 

National Commission on Accrediting, minutes of meeting June 28, 1952; and 
program 

21-26 

Resume of minutes of the meeting of the National Commission on Accrediting, 
January 7, 1952 

27-31 

National Commission on Accrediting, statement of expense 1950-1951 32 

Letter from Lawrence Bethel, New Haven YMCA Junior College Division to 
George Frost re Dr. Frost's visit, along with a brief report and suggestions, 
and Mr. Bethel's acceptance to give the commencement address; October 22, 
1952 

33, 40-43 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting to George Frost re 
appointment of Dr. Fred Pinkham as executive secretary; March 4, 1952 

34 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re receipt of check for 
membership; October 22, 1952 

35 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re changes in the Regional 
Associations of the National commission; September 20, 1952 

36-37 

Chapter 332: an act authorizing the school committee of any city or town 
which conducts an extended course of instruction on junior college level for 
veterans and others to grant certain degrees to persons completing such 
course; May 18, 1948 

38 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re minutes of meeting June 
28, 1952 

39 

Invoice noting receipt of membership dues in National Commission on 
Accrediting, August 29, 1952; September 1, 1953 

44, 64 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re accrediting graduate 
programs; November 7, 1952 

45 

Program letter no. one from National Commission on Accrediting re various 
professional associations' accrediting institutions of higher education 

46-47 

National Commission on Accrediting list of members, January 1952 48 

Letter from the City of Holyoke, Superintendent of Schools, William Peck, to 49, 53 
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George Frost re letter from Commissioner Desmond in regard to the junior 
college; October 21, 1948; copy of letter 

Thank you to George Frost from Judson Butler; October 25, 1948 50 

Page from a Bulletin? re Holyoke Junior College 51 

College and university facilities survey from Dept. of Health, education and 
welfare, 1956? [not filled in] 

52 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re evolution of NCATE 
program; December 30, 1954 

54 

National Commission on Accrediting progress report; November 1953 55-63 

Receipt of check for membership in National Commission on Accrediting, 
November 13, 1953 

64 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re minutes of annual meeting; 
April 20, 1953 

66 

National Commission on Accrediting facts and functions booklet 67-68 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re developing a program of 
accreditation of teacher education; December 3, 1954 

69 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re approval of cooperative 
evaluation of institutions by Regional Associations; December 3, 1954 

70-71 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re questionnaire 72 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re list accredited institutions; 
December 20, 1943 

73 

Program letter no. 5 from National Commission on Accrediting re American 
association of University Women, AAUW; progress report forms; and new 
agencies; December 20, 1953 

74-75 

Letter from National Commission on Accrediting re report to presidents of 
member institutions; November 4, 1955 

76-77 

Report of a special meeting of the committee on professional education from 
North Central Association of Colleges and Secondary Schools; Jan. 7, 1955 

78-81 

Non-Regionally Accredited Institutions of Higher Education by William Selden, 
National Commission on Accrediting 

82-85 

Letter from Massachusetts Teacher Association re disability insurance for its 
members 

86-88 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-18 (Old Box 95T) PAGES 

Athletic awards, coach Michael Begley, in the Southern New England Small 
College Basketball Conference: varsity awards in basketball, cheerleader 
awards, intramural awards in basketball, bowling, recognition of outstanding 
citizenship, student council award, veterans club presentation 

1-2, 26-27 

Averages for graduation? 3-4 

1st Holyoke Junior College awards assembly, May 1961, awarding of the 
annual prizes.  Portions of these pages.  Additional copies. 

5-6, 10-18, 
24-25,34-35 

Averages for graduation 7-8, 28-29 

Athletic awards, basketball, cheerleader, baseball, hockey 9 

Class standing for candidates for graduation 19-20 

Athletic awards; May 13, 1964 21-23 

Note indicating names to be applied to plaques of Holyoke Junior College for 
1961. 1962, 1963 

30 

Holyoke Junior College annual awards assembly May 24, 1961 31 

Annual prize speaking contest for the William Whiting prize of $25 for 
excellence in public speaking: contestants, their topics, and judges; May 24, 
1964 

32-33 

Athletic awards 36-37 

Handwritten note from Wallace Goldstein: contestants for speech contest, 
their names and topics 

38 

Handwritten note with 3 names and topics for speeches? 39 

Another handwritten note with list of names (of speech contestants?) 39 

Annual prize speaking contest for the William Whiting prize of $25 for 
excellence in public speaking; May 15, 1963.  May 6, 1966 

40-41, 42 

Proposed new salary schedule at the junior college 43-48 

Holyoke Junior College faculty for 1957-58 49-51 

Cover letter, including resume, from Lazzeri Alexander seeking employment 
as instructor; January 14, 1958 

52 

List of new instructors and their addresses; 1957-1958 53, 67 

Numbers of new faculty for 1957-1958 and types of degrees held; includes lab 
assistants 

54 

Holyoke Junior College faculty for 1957-1958, mimeographed sheets 55-62 

Faculty pay roll for Sept. 16 to Oct. 16, 1957; includes library pay roll 63-64 

List of faculty and their addresses 65-66 

Faculty pay roll for Sept. 14, 1959 to October 1957; includes library pay roll 68-69 

Faculty pay roll for October 12, 1959 to Nov, 1959; includes library pay roll 70-71 

Faculty pay roll for Nov. 16, 1959 to Dec. 18, 1959; includes library pay roll 72-73 

Faculty pay roll for Jan. 1, 1960 to Jan. 29, 1960; includes library pay roll 74-75 

Faculty pay roll for Feb. 1, 1960 to Feb. 28?; includes library pay roll 76-77 

List of faculty with their addresses and salaries 78-79 

Faculty pay roll for March 7, 1960 to April 8, 1960; includes library pay roll 80-81 

Faculty pay roll for April 11-May 6, 1960; includes library pay roll 82-83 

Faculty pay roll for May 9-June 10, 1960; includes library pay roll 84-85 

Faculty pay roll for June 13-June 24, 1960 86 

Faculty salaries, 2nd semester, 1956-1957 school year 87-88 

Holyoke Junior College faculty school year 1956-1957 89-93 

Faculty pay roll for Sept. 17-Oct. 19, 1956; includes library pay roll 94-95 
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Faculty pay roll for October 22-November 16, 1956; includes library pay roll 96-97 

Holyoke Junior College student library assignments, October 3, 1956 98 

Holyoke School Committee voted a new salary schedule for second semester 
1957: lists degrees, steps, and rates 

99 

Faculty pay roll for November 19-December 14, 1956; includes library pay roll 100-101 

List of faculty and their pay scales 102 

List of faculty and their pay scales, February 11, 1957 103-104 

Faculty pay roll for January 2-February 8, 1957; includes library pay roll 105-106 

Faculty pay roll for February 11-June 14, 1957; includes library pay roll 107-108 

Faculty pay roll for March 11-april 5, 1957; includes library pay roll 109-110 

Faculty pay roll for April 8-May 10, 1957 ; includes library pay roll 111-112 

Faculty pay roll for May 13-June 10, 1957; includes library pay roll 113-114 

Note from Walter Hopkins to George Frost re a completed card; Sept. 1, 1955 115 

Letter from Walter Hopkins to George Frost re possibility of teaching at 
Holyoke Junior College in the Fall of 1955; June 12, 1955 

116 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-19 (Old Box 95U) PAGES 

Letter from microscope repair service raising rates; December 18, 1962 1 

Memo from George Frost to Messrs. Tourville, Ladeau, and Malone 
requesting list of microscopes in need of adjustment or repair; January 16, 
1963 

2 

Order for Printing for 1963 for junior college submitted to the Trade High 
School; from desk of George Frost, Victor Thomas, Dean Robertson, Mary 
Cameron, Dean of Women, Michael Szwed, Richard Myers, Ruth McIntyre, 
Marion Copeland, William McManus, Joseph DeMuro 

3 

Supplies for junior college for 1962; requisition list; mimeographed list and 
carbon copy 

4-15 

Faculty pay roll for September 15-October 17, 1958; includes library pay roll 16-17 

Faculty pay roll for October 20- November 1958; includes library pay roll 18-19 

Faculty pay roll for November 17-December 1958; includes library pay roll 20-21 

Faculty pay roll for January 5-February 6, 1959; includes library pay roll 22-23 

Faculty pay roll for February 9-March 6, 1959; includes library pay roll 24-25 

Faculty pay roll for March 9-April 3 1959; includes library pay roll 26-27 

Faculty pay roll for April 6-May8, 1959; includes library pay roll 28-29 

Faculty pay roll for May 11-June 11, 1959; includes library pay roll 30-31 

Faculty pay roll for September 14-October 12, 1960; includes library pay roll 32-33 

Faculty pay roll for October 13-November 11, 1960; includes library pay roll 34-35 

Faculty pay roll for November 14- December 16, 1960; includes library pay roll 36-37 

Faculty pay roll for January 3-February 3, 1961; includes library pay roll 38-39 

Faculty pay roll for February 6-March 3, 1961; includes library pay roll 40-41 

Faculty pay roll for March 6-april 7, 1961; includes library pay roll 42-43 

Faculty pay roll for April 10-May 5, 1961; includes library pay roll 44-45 

Faculty pay roll for May 7-June 9, 1961; includes library pay roll 46-47 

New England School Development Council, annual school board conference, 
in Boston; March 21, 1958. Agenda. Summary of panel talks includes George 
Frost, who spoke about the local 2 year community college and how it holds 
the key to an economical solution to college education 

48-51 

Memo from American Association of Junior Colleges to its membership re 
annual meeting and amendments passed; March 29, 1962 

52 

Copy of expenses incurred for attending American Association of Junior 
Colleges annual convention 

53 

Letter from American Association of Junior Colleges re intercollegiate athletics 
in junior colleges enrolling men students; questionnaire 

54-60 

American Society for Engineering Education, Technical Institute Division, 
report of meeting at RPI, June 20-24, 1949.  Bylaws of the Society. 

61-64 

Program of Technical Institute Div. Held June 19-23, 1950.  Nominating form 
for Institute award. 

65-68 

Faculty handbook: forward, philosophy of the college 69-74 

List of suggested topics for Faculty Handbook 75,83 

Table of contents for Faculty Handbook 76-79 

Approved contents for Faculty Handbook 80-82 

Institute on College and University Administration workshop will be held June 
22-26 (no year) 

84 

2 week workshop on the community college held at Univ. of Michigan, June 85 
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29-July 10, 1959; dated November 10, 1958 

Salary schedule for instructors at the junior college; 11/29/54 86 

National Association of Secondary School Principals, a department of the 
National Education Association, annual convention meeting in New York City, 
February 10-14, 1951.  Occupational follow-up and adjustment service plan.  
Your professional organization…why you should belong.  For protection and 
emergency needs, group life insurance for members.   

87-90 

Department of Adult Education of the National Education Association.  
National Association of Student Councils, purposes and aims.  Order forms.  
Application blank to National Honor Society.  National Honor Society of 
Secondary Schools, pamphlet.   

91-96 

New England and Middle Atlantic States Junior college Workshop, June 15-
17, 1956.  Program and workshop schedule.  Registration form. 

97-99 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-20 (Old Box 95V) PAGES 

Director's honor roll, September 14, 1959 to January 29, 1960 1-2 

Director's honor roll, September 12, 1960 to February 3, 1961 3-4 

Handwritten list of names with averages 5-6, 36, 43 

Director's honor roll, February 6 to March 31, 1961 7-8, 34-
35,103-104 

Director's honor roll, September 11 to November 8, 1961 9-10, 13-14 

Director's honor roll, dated February 15, 1962, pages 2&3 11-12,15-16 

Director's honor roll, September 11, 1961 to January 31, 1962 17-18,47, 
51-53 

Consolidated copy of Director's honor roll for the academic year…Includes all 
groups whether on honor roll both semester, first or second semester 

19 

Director's honor roll, February 4 to June 10, 1963 20-23 

Director's honor roll, February 5 to March 30, 1962 24,37,56-59 

Director's honor roll,, April 3 to June 9, 1961 25-26 

Director's honor roll, dated July 11, 1962 27-28 

Director's honor roll, 4/21/61 29 

Director's honor roll, April 9 to June 8, 1962 30 

Director's honor roll, September 12 to November 9, 1962 31-33,38-40 

Director's honor roll, dated April 22, 1963 42 

Director's honor roll, February 5 to March 22, 1963 44-45, 48 

Director's honor roll, March 26 to June 8, 1964 49-50 

Handwritten lists of names with averages 54,55,70 

Director's honor roll, September 12, 1963 to January 29, 1964 60-61,65-66 

Director's honor roll, February 3 to March 26, 1964 62-64 

Director's honor roll, September - November 8, 1963 67-69 

Director's honor roll, September 11 to November 10, 1960 71-72,101-
102 

Director's honor roll, February 1 to March 25, 1960 73-74,75-76 

Director's honor roll, September 14, 1959 to January 29, 1960 77,81 

Handwritten lists of names with averages 78,85,87-88 

Computations for honor roll or honor society, lists courses and averages 79-80 

Director's honor roll, September 9 to November 8, 1963 82-84 

Cheat sheet for averages for entire year 86 

Computations for honor roll with names, courses, and averages 89-99 

Director's honor roll, April 10 to June 10, 1960 100,105 
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DESCRIPTIONS OF ITEMS IN 11.02-23 (Old Box 127) PAGES 

Second meeting of the Community Advisory Committee for HCC – 11/7/58  1-2, 3-4 

HJC – A statement in support of the Requested revision of the faculty salary 
schedule at the HJC – 11/7/58 

5-7 

Statement prepared by the Salary Committee of Holyoke Junior College for 
the Holyoke School Committee – 11/3/58 

9-12 
 

The future of Holyoke Junior College? CA. 1959? 13-18, 19-
24, 25-30 

HJC – Recommendation of the Advisory Committee of the Holyoke Junior 
College to the Holyoke School Committee – 10/24/60 

31 

HJC – Community Advisory Committee 33-34, 35-
36 

Chapter 605 – The Commonwealth of Massachusetts (1958) An Act 
establishing a Massachusetts Board of Regional Community Colleges and 
Providing for the establishment of regional community Colleges 

37-41, 42-
46 

HJC – Principles and facts behind legislation establishing and administering 
public junior or community colleges with emphasis on local control – 4/2/57 

47-52 

Massachusetts Teachers Association – Legislative Bulletin VI – 5/6/57 53-56 
 


